

**BID #20-1220E3-031 LIGHT BULBS
OPENED 10/22/2019**

DESCRIPTION			WESCO				SALSA APPAREL - MWBE/DBE				COOPER FREIDMAN				SHANOR				
			EST QTY	PACK OUT	SUB	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	SUB	PACK OUT	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	SUB	PACK OUT	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	SUB	PACK OUT	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
4WATT MINI	NIGHT LIGHT		50	50		\$ 0.25	\$ 12.50	S4724	24	\$ 0.99	\$ 49.50					415422	24	\$ 6.31	\$ 315.50
25WATT	MED BASE FROSTED		200	50		\$ 0.39	\$ 78.00	S3815	25	\$ 1.00	\$ 200.00	10645		\$ 0.75	\$ 150.00	415331	12	\$ 3.85	\$ 770.00
40A	40WATT APPLIANCE BULB	INCANDE SCENT	200	20		\$ 0.45	\$ 90.00	S3810	25	\$ 0.79	\$ 158.00	10133		\$ 1.19	\$ 238.00	416768	60	\$ 2.20	\$ 440.00
60A	60 WATT A19 FROST MED	INCANDE SCENT	500	10	73885	\$ 1.45	\$ 725.00	LED 229836	6	\$ 3.94	\$ 1,970.00	73885		\$ 1.44	\$ 720.00	149799	120	\$ 6.35	\$ 3,175.00
75A	75 WATT A19 FROST MED	INCANDE SCENT	300	10	79291	\$ 3.15	\$ 945.00	LED S29811	6	\$ 5.95	\$ 1,785.00	79291		\$ 3.00	\$ 900.00				\$ -
100A	100WATT A19 FROST MED	INCANDE SCENT	300	10	79292	\$ 3.75	\$ 1,125.00	LED S29816	6	\$ 7.95	\$ 2,385.00	79292		\$ 3.60	\$ 1,080.00	149716	60	\$ 5.00	\$ 1,500.00
150A/21/IF	150A-		100	10	####	\$ 1.25	\$ 125.00	LED S8647	24	\$ 10.95	\$ 1,095.00	13148		\$ 1.25	\$ 125.00				\$ -
150A	150WATT A21 FROST MED	INCANDE SCENT	300	10	####	\$ 1.25	\$ 375.00	S3945	24	\$ 1.10	\$ 330.00	13148		\$ 1.25	\$ 375.00				\$ -
200A	200WATT A23 FROST MED	INCANDE SCENT	30	10	####	\$ 1.45	\$ 43.50	S3957	24	\$ 2.59	\$ 77.70	15505		\$ 1.45	\$ 43.50				\$ -
300IF	300WATT PS35 FROST	INCANDE SCENT	30	24	####	\$ 2.55	\$ 76.50	S4962	12	\$ 5.29	\$ 158.70	15739		\$ 2.38	\$ 71.40				\$ -
SLS20	20 WATT MED BASE SCREW	CAMPACT FL	500	10	####	\$ 4.10	\$ 2,050.00	S7234	12	\$ 4.19	\$ 2,095.00	26347		\$ 3.95	\$ 1,975.00				\$ -
EL/MDT 23WATT	23 WATT MED BASE SCREW	CAMPACT FL	500	10	####	\$ 3.35	\$ 1,675.00	S7227	12	\$ 4.15	\$ 2,075.00	29978		\$ 3.15	\$ 1,575.00				\$ -
SLS25	25 WATT MED BASE SCREW	CAMPACT FL	500	10	####	\$ 3.35	\$ 1,675.00	S7231	12	\$ 4.79	\$ 2,395.00	29978		\$ 3.15	\$ 1,575.00				\$ -
50W	12V BASE GY6.35 TYPE		25	10		\$ 0.40	\$ 10.00	S3121	48	\$ 1.69	\$ 42.25			\$ -	\$ -	415596	12	\$ 11.10	\$ 277.50
DT40/35/RS			25	10		\$ 3.25	\$ 81.25	S8667	10	\$ 5.87	\$ 146.75	20585		\$ 5.26	\$ 131.50	300434	10	\$ 6.55	\$ 163.75
100A/RS/TF	100WATT		40	48		\$ 0.87	\$ 34.80	S3932	12	\$ 1.49	\$ 59.60	79292		\$ 3.53	\$ 141.20	149716	60	\$ 5.00	\$ 200.00
60T 10F/CD	#22178-8		20	48		\$ 2.10	\$ 42.00	LED S9892	25	\$ 8.49	\$ 169.80	18711		\$ 2.35	\$ 47.00				\$ -
JDDC BAYONET BA15D 150WATT		HALOGEN BULB	200	10		\$ 0.94	\$ 188.00	S3122	12	\$ 4.49	\$ 898.00			\$ -	\$ -	416347	12	\$ 11.10	\$ 2,220.00

755 MINI BAYONET BASE		INDICATOR	300	10		\$ 0.21	\$ 63.00	S6918	10	\$ 0.95	\$ 285.00			\$ -			\$ -	
31024 T5/835			150	25		\$ 2.30	\$ 345.00	S8138	40	\$ 8.85	\$ 1,327.50	20904	\$ 2.30	\$ 345.00	290205	40	\$ 6.55	\$ 982.50
T5/854 TUBES			500	25		\$ 1.94	\$ 970.00	S8144	40	\$ 4.79	\$ 2,395.00			\$ -			\$ -	
T5 F28/835			5000	25		\$ 1.90	\$ 9,500.00	S81323	40	\$ 5.59	\$ 27,950.00	20901	\$ 2.00	\$ 10,000.00	206136	15	\$ 15.70	\$ 78,500.00
T5 F54/835			1000	25		\$ 1.94	\$ 1,940.00	S8144	40	\$ 4.79	\$ 4,790.00	20904	\$ 2.30	\$ 2,300.00	290288	40	\$ 2.45	\$ 2,450.00
F54T5/835/HO	54WATT HIGH OUTPUT	FLOURESCENT	500	25		\$ 1.94	\$ 970.00	S8144	40	\$ 4.79	\$ 2,395.00	20904	\$ 2.30	\$ 1,150.00	417816	40	\$ 7.60	\$ 3,800.00
F39T5/ 835/HO	39WATT HIGH OUTPUT	FLOURESCENT	500	25		\$ 2.30	\$ 1,150.00	S8141	40	\$ 6.69	\$ 3,345.00	20933	\$ 4.91	\$ 2,455.00	290239	40	\$ 6.55	\$ 3,275.00
F49 T5/HO/841			500	25		\$ 2.30	\$ 1,150.00	S8142	40	\$ 6.69	\$ 3,345.00	21071	\$ 5.42	\$ 2,710.00	220525	40	\$ 7.35	\$ 3,675.00
F15T8 CW	15 WATT SETRVING		50	30		\$ 1.05	\$ 52.50	S7949	24	\$ 1.69	\$ 84.50	21616	\$ 1.82	\$ 91.00	407197	25	\$ 3.30	\$ 165.00
F6 T5/CW			100	10		\$ 0.70	\$ 70.00	S1902	20	\$ 1.88	\$ 188.00	21365	\$ 2.20	\$ 220.00	332411	25	\$ 13.30	\$ 1,330.00
F17T8/TL/700 SERIES	17 WATT 24IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	300	25		\$ 1.75	\$ 525.00	700 SERIES			DISCONTINUED	\$ -	21769	\$ 1.95	\$ 585.00			\$ -
F25T8/TL/700 SERIES	25 WATT 36IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	6000	25		\$ 1.82	\$ 10,920.00	700 SERIES			DISCONTINUED	\$ -	22139	\$ 1.95	\$ 11,700.00			\$ -
F17T8/TL/800 SERIES	17 WATT 24IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	6000	25		\$ 1.82	\$ 10,920.00	S8405	30	\$ 3.96	\$ 23,760.00	22136	\$ 1.95	\$ 11,700.00	281881	30	\$ 2.70	\$ 16,200.00
F25T8/TL/800 SERIES	25 WATT 36IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	2000	25		\$ 1.94	\$ 3,880.00	S8411	30	\$ 4.02	\$ 8,040.00	22139	\$ 1.95	\$ 3,900.00	281907	30	\$ 2.65	\$ 5,300.00
F8/T5/841/ECO	BI PIN	FLOURESCENT	500	25		\$ 2.09	\$ 1,045.00	S1904	20	\$ 1.88	\$ 940.00	21366	\$ 1.95	\$ 975.00	391144	12	\$ 14.75	\$ 7,375.00
F24 T5/HO/835			500	25		\$ 2.30	\$ 1,150.00	S8138	40	\$ 8.86	\$ 4,430.00	20929	\$ 2.38	\$ 1,190.00	290205	40	\$ 6.55	\$ 3,275.00
F8/T5/841/ECO	BI PIN	FLOURESCENT	500	25		\$ 2.09	\$ 1,045.00	S1904	20	\$ 1.88	\$ 940.00	21366	\$ 1.95	\$ 975.00	332478	25	\$ 4.55	\$ 2,275.00
FB031 T8 /835			250	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,375.00	S8451	15	\$ 7.14	\$ 1,785.00	21695	\$ 7.35	\$ 1,837.50			\$ -	
F28/T5/835/ECO	BI PIN	FLOURESCENT	2000	25		\$ 2.01	\$ 4,020.00	S81323	40	\$ 5.59	\$ 11,180.00	20901	\$ 2.00	\$ 4,000.00	230854	40	\$ 5.95	\$ 11,900.00
F31 T8/SPX35/U			2000	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 11,000.00	S8451	15	\$ 7.14	\$ 14,280.00	21695	\$ 7.35	\$ 14,700.00			\$ -	
F32T8/TL/835	32 WATT 48IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	6000	25		\$ 1.40	\$ 8,400.00	S8419	30	\$ 2.89	\$ 17,340.00	21779	\$ 1.30	\$ 7,800.00	479600	30	\$ 2.40	\$ 14,400.00
FC40 T5/841	40WATT CIRCLE LAMP	FLOURESCENT	600	12		\$ 14.50	\$ 8,700.00	SS8160	12	\$ 13.96	\$ 8,376.00	20732	\$ 13.53	\$ 8,118.00	148593	10	\$ 17.20	\$ 10,320.00
F32T8/TL/700 SERIES	32 WATT 48IN. T8 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	6000	25	800 se	\$ 1.40	\$ 8,400.00	S8419	30	\$ 2.89	\$ 17,340.00	21779	\$ 1.30	\$ 7,800.00			\$ -	
F24T5/800 SERIES/HO	24 WATT 22IN.T5 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	6000	25		\$ 2.30	\$ 13,800.00	S8138	40	\$ 8.86	\$ 53,160.00	20929	\$ 2.38	\$ 14,280.00	220913	12	\$ 19.05	\$ 114,300.00
F34/CW/RS/EW ALTO	34WATT 48IN T12 LAMP	FLOURESCENT	300	30		\$ 1.70	\$ 510.00	S6637	30	\$ 2.89	\$ 867.00	24588	\$ 1.56	\$ 468.00			\$ -	

F40SPEC35	40 WATT 48 IN T12 LAMP	FLOURES CENT	20	30		\$ 1.94	\$ 38.80		DISCONTINUED	\$ -	22434		\$ 1.94	\$ 38.80			\$ -	
FBO31/800 SERIES	31 WATT U BENT 1.5/8	FLOURES CENT	1000	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 5,500.00	S8451	15	\$ 7.14	\$ 7,140.00	21695	\$ 7.35	\$ 7,350.00	226712	15	\$ 8.60	\$ 8,600.00
ITEM	32 WATT		6000	12		\$ 4.95	\$ 29,700.00	S8457	16	\$ 8.95	\$ 53,700.00	21670	\$ 5.59	\$ 33,540.00	379008	20	\$ 6.95	\$ 41,700.00
FBO32T8/700 SERIES /U6	32 WATT U BENT 6IN	FLOURES CENT	1000	12		\$ 4.95	\$ 4,950.00	S8457	16	\$ 8.95	\$ 8,950.00	21670	\$ 5.59	\$ 5,590.00	434522	10	\$ 13.70	\$ 13,700.00
F40/30BX/5PX 35	40 WATT U BENT	FLOURES CENT	1000	12		\$ 5.55	\$ 5,550.00	S8666	10	\$ 5.89	\$ 5,890.00	20585	\$ 5.26	\$ 5,260.00				\$ -
F40/CW/40W			100	30		\$ 1.70	\$ 170.00	S6637	30	\$ 3.15	\$ 315.00	24588	\$ 1.56	\$ 156.00				\$ -
F2/W/T5/841			100	25	F24T 5/84 1/HO	\$ 2.30	\$ 230.00	S8130	40	\$ 5.67	\$ 567.00		\$ -					\$ -
F14/W/T5/841			100	25		\$ 1.94	\$ 194.00	S8127	40	\$ 5.59	\$ 559.00	20908	\$ 5.87	\$ 587.00	230805	40	\$ 6.55	\$ 655.00
F20 T12/CW			100	25		\$ 1.40	\$ 140.00	S6565	30	\$ 2.98	\$ 298.00	22078	\$ 1.62	\$ 162.00	273326	30	\$ 2.20	\$ 220.00
F18/TBX/841/A			100	50		\$ 2.35	\$ 235.00	S8344	50	\$ 5.98	\$ 598.00	20878	\$ 6.55	\$ 655.00	458232	10	\$ 7.00	\$ 700.00
F30 T12/HL	FOOD SERVING		100	25		\$ 2.05	\$ 205.00	S6571	30	\$ 4.97	\$ 497.00	23476	\$ 1.92	\$ 192.00	392159	6	\$ 23.55	\$ 2,355.00
F48 T12/CW/HO			100	15		\$ 3.60	\$ 360.00	S6670	30	\$ 9.86	\$ 986.00	25146	\$ 3.75	\$ 375.00				\$ -
F64 T12/CW/HO			100	15		\$ 8.75	\$ 875.00	S6672	30	\$ 14.77	\$ 1,477.00	25352	\$ 7.95	\$ 795.00				\$ -
F96 T12/CW/HO	HUTCH OUTSIDE SIGN		100	15		\$ 4.30	\$ 430.00	S6676	15	\$ 6.97	\$ 697.00	25134	\$ 4.04	\$ 404.00				\$ -
75PAR30/HAL/FL	75 WATT PAR 30 FLOOD	HALOGEN	300	12		\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	S2243	15	\$ 8.97	\$ 2,691.00	16140	\$ 10.50	\$ 3,150.00				\$ -
75PAR30/HAL/FL	75 WATT PAR 30 FLOOD	HALOGEN	300	12		\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	S2237	15	\$ 8.97	\$ 2,691.00	16128	\$ 7.75	\$ 2,325.00				\$ -
50WATT PAR 30	SHORT NECK TRACK LIGHT		300	12		\$ 3.00	\$ 900.00	S2330	15	\$ 6.79	\$ 2,037.00	16125	\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00				\$ -
50WATT PAR 20	MED BASE FLOOD FL2500		300	12		\$ 2.60	\$ 780.00	S2232	15	\$ 5.12	\$ 1,536.00	16104	\$ 4.00	\$ 1,200.00				\$ -
H120/BR/40/FL	FLOOD		300	12		\$ -	\$ -	S7011	24	\$ 7.87	\$ 2,361.00		\$ -	\$ -	416750	4	\$ 10.15	\$ 3,045.00
90 PAR38/HAL/FL	90 WATT PAR 38 FLOOD	HALOGEN	300	12		\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	S12216	12	\$ 8.49	\$ 2,547.00	16591	\$ 8.16	\$ 2,448.00				\$ -
120 PAR/38	100WATT 25 DEG BEAM		300	12		\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	S9444	12	\$ 12.47	\$ 3,741.00	16591	\$ 8.16	\$ 2,448.00				\$ -
500 PAR-56 MFL FLOOD LAMP PHILLIPS			100	12		\$ 17.00	\$ 1,700.00	S4346	12	\$ 24.49	\$ 2,449.00		\$ -					\$ -
JC50 107014 12V 50 WATT	PRISM OR EQUAL		100	10		\$ 0.45	\$ 45.00	S3121	48	\$ 2.11	\$ 211.00		\$ -					\$ -
JD250DC			100	10		\$ 2.00	\$ 200.00	S3123	12	\$ 4.57	\$ 457.00		\$ -					\$ -
300WATT CFL	E39 MOGUL		100	10		\$ 5.00	\$ 500.00	S7387	12	\$ 28.51	\$ 2,851.00		\$ -					\$ -

HP 20NFL-50			25	12		\$ 2.60	\$ 65.00				\$ -			\$ -				\$ -
75 WATT	SODIUM MOGUL BASE		200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S1930	12	\$ 10.29	\$ 2,058.00			\$ -				\$ -
C70S62	70 WATT MOG BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S1930	12	\$ 10.29	\$ 2,058.00	67512	\$ 10.25	\$ 2,050.00				\$ -
C70S62/MED	70 WATT MED BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S3127	12	\$ 9.95	\$ 1,990.00	67504	\$ 10.75	\$ 2,150.00				\$ -
C100S54	100 WATT MED BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S1931	12	\$ 10.29	\$ 2,058.00	67514	\$ 10.50	\$ 2,100.00				\$ -
C100S54/MED	100 WATT MED BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S3128	12	\$ 12.97	\$ 2,594.00	67506	\$ 10.25	\$ 2,050.00				\$ -
C150S55	150 WATT MOG BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S1932	12	\$ 10.11	\$ 2,022.00	67516	\$ 11.00	\$ 2,200.00				\$ -
C150S55/MED	150 WATT MED BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S3129	12	\$ 11.39	\$ 2,278.00	67508	\$ 10.80	\$ 2,160.00				\$ -
C2500S50	250 WATT MOG BASE CLEAR	HPS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 6.75	\$ 1,350.00	S1940	12	\$ 9.97	\$ 1,994.00	67578	\$ 11.60	\$ 2,320.00				\$ -
C35S76	HPS 35 WATT	HIGH PRESS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S3130	12	\$ 11.09	\$ 2,218.00	67500	\$ 9.95	\$ 1,990.00				\$ -
C100S54	HPS 100WATT E26	HIGH PRESS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S3128	12	\$ 12.97	\$ 2,594.00	67506	\$ 10.40	\$ 2,080.00				\$ -
C250S50	HPS ED18- 250WATT	HIGH PRESS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 6.75	\$ 1,350.00	S1940	12	\$ 9.97	\$ 1,994.00	67578	\$ 11.60	\$ 2,320.00				\$ -
C400S51	400 WATT MOG BASE CLEAR	HIGH PRESS SODIUM	200	12		\$ 6.75	\$ 1,350.00	S1941	12	\$ 9.97	\$ 1,994.00	67533	\$ 11.70	\$ 2,340.00				\$ -
MP 70W/U/UVS/P5		METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5856	12	\$ 13.86	\$ 2,772.00	64836	\$ 17.65	\$ 3,530.00				\$ -

MP70/U/MED	100 WATT MED BASE	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5856	12	\$ 13.86	\$ 2,772.00	64818	\$ 19.40	\$ 3,880.00	419473	12	\$ 33.55	\$ 6,710.00
MP70/U/MED PS	100 WATT MED BASE CLEAR PULSE	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5856	12	\$ 13.86	\$ 2,772.00	64818	\$ 19.40	\$ 3,880.00				\$ -
MXR70/U/MED/			200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5856	12	\$ 15.61	\$ 3,122.00	64836	\$ 17.65	\$ 3,530.00				\$ -
MH100/U/MED	M90/M140	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5858	12	\$ 12.58	\$ 2,516.00	64818	\$ 19.40	\$ 3,880.00	419515	12	\$ 27.50	\$ 5,500.00
MH100/U/MED /PS ED17	BASE E26	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S4849	12	\$ 13.49	\$ 2,698.00	64818	\$ 19.40	\$ 3,880.00				\$ -
MH100/U/MED	100 WATT MED BASE	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5858	12	\$ 12.58	\$ 2,516.00	64818	\$ 19.40	\$ 3,880.00	419515	12	\$ 27.50	\$ 5,500.00
MHC/150 MED	PROBE START		200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S4379	12	\$ 17.49	\$ 3,498.00	64785	\$ 17.25	\$ 3,450.00	354621	12	\$ 18.70	\$ 3,740.00
MHC150/102	PULSE START		200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5860	12	\$ 16.05	\$ 3,210.00	64785	\$ 17.25	\$ 3,450.00				\$ -
400W METAL HALIDE	ED28	MH400/U	300	6		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	S5843	12	\$ 22.19	\$ 6,657.00	64034	\$ 17.25	\$ 5,175.00	426023	12	\$ 27.15	\$ 8,145.00
400W METAL HALIDE	BALLAST 135E PARKING LOT	MH400/U	300	6		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	LPT83711	1	\$ 78.19	\$ 23,457.00	64036	\$ 11.75	\$ 3,525.00	426023	12	\$ 27.15	\$ 8,145.00
250W METAL HALIDE	BALLAST 138E PARKING LOT	MH250/U	300	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	LPT83708	1	\$ 69.88	\$ 20,964.00	64032	\$ 12.40	\$ 3,720.00	274845	12	\$ 20.40	\$ 6,120.00
MH150/U/MED	<u>ED17</u>	METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S4379	12	\$ 17.49	\$ 3,498.00	64785	\$ 17.25	\$ 3,450.00				\$ -
MH150/U/MED PS		METAL HALIDE	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5860	12	\$ 16.08	\$ 3,216.00	64785	\$ 17.25	\$ 3,450.00				\$ -
MH175/U	M57E	METAL HALIDE	300	12		\$ 12.00	\$ 3,600.00	S4826	12	\$ 17.49	\$ 5,247.00	64030	\$ 10.95	\$ 3,285.00	287334	12	\$ 20.30	\$ 6,090.00
MH175/U/MED	175 WATT MED BASE	METAL HALIDE	300	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	S4863	12	\$ 16.96	\$ 5,088.00	64479	\$ 13.85	\$ 4,155.00	313585	12	\$ 24.10	\$ 7,230.00
MVR 175/U	175 WATT	MULTIVA POR	300	12		\$ 12.00	\$ 3,600.00	S4829	12	\$ 17.49	\$ 5,247.00	64030	\$ 10.95	\$ 3,285.00				\$ -
MH250/U/M58/E	250WATTS	METAL HALIDE	300	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	S4831	6	\$ 20.95	\$ 6,285.00	64032	\$ 12.40	\$ 3,720.00	274845	12	\$ 20.30	\$ 6,090.00
MH250/U	250 WATT MOG BASE	METAL HALIDE	300	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	S4831	6	\$ 20.95	\$ 6,285.00	64032	\$ 12.40	\$ 3,720.00	274845	12	\$ 20.30	\$ 6,090.00
MP250/BU/PS		METAL HALIDE	300	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 2,700.00	S5882	12	\$ 23.88	\$ 7,164.00	69789	\$ 25.25	\$ 7,575.00	207563	12	\$ 33.50	\$ 10,050.00
MV250X/U	250 WATT MOG BASE	MULTIVA POR	200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S4831	6	\$ 20.95	\$ 4,190.00	64032	\$ 12.40	\$ 2,480.00	274845	12	\$ 20.30	\$ 4,060.00
MP320/BU/PS			200	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5883	12	\$ 53.19	\$ 10,638.00	64391	\$ 23.40	\$ 4,680.00				\$ -
MVR400/C/VBU/ ED28/PA		MULTIVA POR	200	6		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S4844	12	\$ 16.66	\$ 3,332.00	64051	\$ 25.25	\$ 5,050.00				\$ -
MH400/U	400 WATT MOG BASE	METAL HALIDE	200	6		\$ 9.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5833	12	\$ 14.97	\$ 2,994.00	64036	\$ 11.75	\$ 2,350.00	274498	6	\$ 20.65	\$ 4,130.00

MH1000/U/BT37			100	6		\$ 18.00	\$ 1,800.00	S5845	12	\$ 37.97	\$ 3,797.00	64469		\$ 35.88	\$ 3,588.00	321505	6	\$ 54.85	\$ 5,485.00
EL/A CAN	9WATT DÉCOR CANDLE		400	10		\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00	S9961	6	\$ 5.95	\$ 2,380.00			\$ -					\$ -
PLC262	60WATT		4000	50		\$ 5.00	\$ 20,000.00	S8326	50	\$ 3.69	\$ 14,760.00			\$ -					\$ -
PL-S7W/27 K35 K41	7 WATT TWIN TUBE 2 PIN	COMPAC T FL	4000	50		\$ 1.20	\$ 4,800.00	S8302	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 9,160.00	21271		\$ 1.71	\$ 6,840.00	148718	10	\$ 1.80	\$ 7,200.00
PL-S9W/27K 35K 41 K	9 WATT TWIN TUBE 2 PIN	COMPAC T FL	4000	50		\$ 1.10	\$ 4,400.00	S8306	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 9,160.00	21272		\$ 1.89	\$ 7,560.00	148676	10	\$ 1.80	\$ 7,200.00
PL-S-13W/27	13 WATT TWIN TUBE 2	COMPAC T FL	2000	50		\$ 1.10	\$ 2,200.00	S8310	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 4,580.00	21136		\$ 1.55	\$ 3,100.00	146811	10	\$ 2.15	\$ 4,300.00
PL-S13W/835/2P	13 WATT TWIN TUBE 2	COMPAC T FL	2000	50		\$ 1.10	\$ 2,200.00	S8311	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 4,580.00	21137		\$ 1.55	\$ 3,100.00	146845	10	\$ 1.80	\$ 3,600.00
PL-S13W/841/ OR 850 2P	13 WATT TWIN TUBE 2	COMPAC T FL	2000	50		\$ 1.10	\$ 2,200.00	S8312	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 4,580.00	21134		\$ 1.55	\$ 3,100.00	146852	10	\$ 3.25	\$ 6,500.00
PL- C18W/827/35K	18 WATT QUAD 2 PIN	COMPAC T FL	300	50		\$ 1.50	\$ 450.00	S8321	50	\$ 4.97	\$ 1,491.00	21109		\$ 4.40	\$ 1,320.00	383166	10	\$ 5.70	\$ 1,710.00
PL- C26W/827/35K	26 WATT QUAD 2 PIN	COMPAC T FL	4000	50		\$ 1.65	\$ 6,600.00	S8325	50	\$ 4.97	\$ 19,880.00	21113		\$ 3.98	\$ 15,920.00	383216	10	\$ 5.75	\$ 23,000.00
F26DBX/835/ECO 4P		COMPAC T FL	4000	50		\$ 1.65	\$ 6,600.00	S8339	50	\$ 5.79	\$ 23,160.00	20684		\$ 3.10	\$ 12,400.00	383364	10	\$ 5.30	\$ 21,200.00
F212D/835/4P			300	50		\$ 1.65	\$ 495.00				\$ -			\$ -					\$ -
HP30FL39/HX			100	15		\$ 3.00	\$ 300.00				\$ -			\$ -					\$ -
C70562 70 WATT ALTO	PHILIPS 36869- 6		200	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,100.00	S1930	12	\$ 10.29	\$ 2,058.00	67512		\$ 10.25	\$ 2,050.00	3687696	12	\$ 16.30	\$ 3,260.00
PL-C13W/27K 35K 41K 4P	13 WATT QUAD 4 PIN	COMPAC T FL	2000	50		\$ 1.45	\$ 2,900.00	S8329	12	\$ 5.79	\$ 11,580.00	20682		\$ 4.26	\$ 8,520.00	383251	10	\$ 5.40	\$ 10,800.00
PL-C24W/27K 35	24WATT QUAD 4 PIN	COMPAC T FL	300	50		\$ 1.70	\$ 510.00				\$ -	20580		\$ 6.26	\$ 1,878.00				\$ -
PL-C18W/27K 35K 41K 4P	18 WATT QUAD 4 PIN	COMPAC T FL	300	50		\$ 1.70	\$ 510.00	S8333	50	\$ 5.79	\$ 1,737.00	20683		\$ 4.35	\$ 1,305.00	383299	10	\$ 6.05	\$ 1,815.00
PL-C26W/27K 35	26 WATT QUAD 4 PIN	COMPAC T FL	4000	50		\$ 1.65	\$ 6,600.00	S8339	50	\$ 5.79	\$ 23,160.00	20684		\$ 3.10	\$ 12,400.00	383349	10	\$ 6.10	\$ 24,400.00
PL-T32W/35/ 4P	32 wat 4 pin		2000	50		\$ 2.30	\$ 4,600.00	S8351	10	\$ 7.09	\$ 14,180.00	20583		\$ 5.85	\$ 11,700.00	458307	10	\$ 7.00	\$ 14,000.00
PLL 35W/835	35WATT BASE 2G11 PHILLIPS		1000	10		\$ 3.20	\$ 3,200.00	S8664	10	\$ 7.14	\$ 7,140.00	20582		\$ 6.25	\$ 6,250.00	349423	10	\$ 8.40	\$ 8,400.00
PLL36/835/350K	36WATT 4PIN		1000	10		\$ 3.20	\$ 3,200.00	S8664	10	\$ 7.14	\$ 7,140.00	20582		\$ 6.25	\$ 6,250.00	349423	10	\$ 8.40	\$ 8,400.00
PL-T32W/35/ 4P	32 wat 4 pin DIMMABLE		1000	50		\$ 2.30	\$ 2,300.00	S8351	50	\$ 7.69	\$ 7,690.00	20583		\$ 5.85	\$ 5,850.00	458307	10	\$ 7.00	\$ 7,000.00
PL 135/E/27	UAE SN160		1000	50		\$ 3.20	\$ 3,200.00	S8366	50	\$ 5.59	\$ 5,590.00			\$ -	146811	10	\$ 2.15	\$ 2,150.00	
PL-T42W/35/ 4P	42 wat 4 pin		4000	50		\$ 3.00	\$ 12,000.00	S8355	50	\$ 7.97	\$ 31,880.00	20781		\$ 6.20	\$ 24,800.00	149021	10	\$ 6.80	\$ 27,200.00
C250 S50 /ALTO	PHILIPS		300	12		\$ 6.75	\$ 2,025.00	S1940	12	\$ 9.97	\$ 2,991.00	67578		\$ 11.60	\$ 3,480.00	147421	12	\$ 21.60	\$ 6,480.00
C50568/M	PHILIPS		300	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,650.00	S3131	12	\$ 9.95	\$ 2,985.00	67502		\$ 11.90	\$ 3,570.00	467308	12	\$ 14.50	\$ 4,350.00

C570562/M	PHILIPS		300	12		\$ 5.50	\$ 1,650.00	S3127	12	\$ 9.95	\$ 2,985.00	67504		\$ 10.75	\$ 3,225.00	467324	12	\$ 22.20	\$ 6,660.00
F5BX/SP27			300	50		\$ 1.20	\$ 360.00	S8300	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 687.00	21279		\$ 1.65	\$ 495.00	146712	10	\$ 2.20	\$ 660.00
F7BX/SP27			300	50		\$ 1.20	\$ 360.00	S8302	50	\$ 2.29	\$ 687.00	21271		\$ 1.65	\$ 495.00	148718	10	\$ 1.80	\$ 540.00
ELA R-33 16	DIMMABLE		250	12		\$ 8.75	\$ 2,187.50	S9620	6	\$ 5.95	\$ 1,487.50	29440		\$ 7.95	\$ 1,987.50				\$ -
F13DBX/835/ECO 4P	DIMMABLE 4 PIN	COMPACT FL	250	50		\$ 1.50	\$ 375.00	S8331	50	\$ 5.19	\$ 1,297.50	20671		\$ 4.30	\$ 1,075.00	383273	10	\$ 5.40	\$ 1,350.00
TL5/C22W/835	DIMMABLE CIRCULAR FLOURESCENT		200	12		\$ 19.00	\$ 3,800.00	S8156	12	\$ 12.09	\$ 2,418.00	20712		\$ 18.00	\$ 3,600.00	391169	12	\$ 3.20	\$ 640.00
F39BX/SPX35/RS	DIMMABLE BIAX COMP		200	10		\$ 6.90	\$ 1,380.00	S8667	10	\$ 5.89	\$ 1,178.00	20582		\$ 6.25	\$ 1,250.00	349423	10	\$ 8.40	\$ 1,680.00
F39BX/SPX30/RS	DIMMABLE BIAX COMP		200	10		\$ 6.90	\$ 1,380.00	S8666	10	\$ 5.89	\$ 1,178.00	20581		\$ 6.25	\$ 1,250.00	345116	10	\$ 8.40	\$ 1,680.00
BIAX 36W F36BX/835	DIMMABLE PL-L36W/835		200	10		\$ 6.90	\$ 1,380.00	S8664	10	\$ 5.89	\$ 1,178.00	20582		\$ 6.25	\$ 1,250.00	349423	10	\$ 8.40	\$ 1,680.00
175w METAL HALIDE	FLAG POLE	MH175/U	200	12		\$ 12.00	\$ 2,400.00	S5829	12	\$ 17.49	\$ 3,498.00	64030		\$ 10.95	\$ 2,190.00	287334	12	\$ 20.30	\$ 4,060.00
MVR70/U/MED	70 W METAL HALIDE MD		500	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 4,500.00	S5856	12	\$ 14.22	\$ 7,110.00	64836		\$ 17.65	\$ 8,825.00				\$ -
	MH70/U/MED		500	12		\$ 9.00	\$ 4,500.00	S5856	12	\$ 14.22	\$ 7,110.00	64836		\$ 17.65	\$ 8,825.00	419473	12	\$ 35.00	\$ 17,500.00
115V 750WX CERAMIC HEAT			150	10		\$ 29.00	\$ 4,350.00				\$ -			\$ -	\$ -				\$ -
115V 575WX CERAMIC HEAT			150	10		\$ 29.00	\$ 4,350.00				\$ -			\$ -	\$ -				\$ -
HG 6229-L24 (This is a clear tube with bi pin)	SELLSTROM HYPER GERMICIDAL	UV LAMP	10	10				S6885	24	\$ 20.69	\$ 206.90			\$ -	\$ -				\$ -
								S6886	24	\$ 29.29	\$ 292.90			\$ -	\$ -				\$ -
						\$ 32.00	\$ 320.00	S6887	24	\$ 42.49	\$ 424.90			\$ -	\$ -				\$ -

*NO BID ON 2 ITEMS \$ 365,802.35

* NO BID ON 10 ITEMS \$ 743,267.00

*NO BID ON 20 ITEMS \$ 484,011.40

*NO BID ON 67 ITEMS \$ 682,059.25

DISADVANTAGED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE

MWE AND MBE

MIN \$1,000 ORDER FOR FREE SHIPPING

ALL ITEMS ARE QUOTED SUBJECT TO ANY NEW TARIFFS

ALL ITEMS ARE QUOTED SUBJECT TO APPROVAL

ANY CHANGES IN THE BILL OF AMATERIAL ABOVE WILL REQUIRE A RE-QUOTE.

AWARD TO WESCO

