

BID #15-16-021 ROCK SALT & ICE MELT		BISON	CORR	JOHN DEER	DOBMEIER	VERITIV CORP	ABC				
OPEN: 8/21/15 - AT: 11:00 A.M.		WB MASON	LAB	DIST	LANDSCAPES	JANITORIAL	XPEDX	HARDWARE			
EST. QTY. 896 BAGS	ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY ICE MELT, 50 LB. BAG #8132475 OR EQUAL										
		COST PER BAG	\$8.63	NO BID	\$6.95	NO BID	\$7.45	\$8.15	NO BID		
		TOTAL	\$7,732.48		\$6,227.20		\$6,675.20	\$7,302.40			
		MFG. (BRAND)	KISSINER		KISSNER		SSS KISSNER	SCOTWOOD TRACTION MELT			
		MFG. NUMBER	KI ENVIRONMELT		MELT SMART	-	WHITE FEVER	7-50045-00017-5			
		BAGS PER PALLET	\$49.00		\$49.00		\$49.00	\$49.00			
		PALLETS PER TRUCKLOAD	\$18.00		\$18.00		\$882.00	\$18.00			
		DAYS INSIDE DELIVERY	\$42,011.00		2-3 DAYS		1 DAY	1 DAY			
		BUFFALO PUBLIC SCHOOL'S PICKUP									
		BAG	N/A		\$6.75		\$7.40	\$7.99			
		BAGS – MINIMUM QUANTITY FOR BPS PICKUP	-		\$49.00		\$14.00	\$49.00			
		6860 BAGS	ROCK SALT, 50 LB. BAGS	COST PER BAG	\$5.28	\$4.50	\$5.95	\$4.23	\$4.40	\$5.89	NO BID
				TOTAL	\$36,220.80	\$30,870.00	\$40,817.00	\$29,017.80	\$30,184.00	\$40,405.40	
MFG. (BRAND)				AMERICAN	AMERICAN	AMERICAN	AMERICAN				
MFG. (BRAND)	KISSNER			ROCK SALT	ROCK SALT	ROCK SALT	ROCK SALT	SCOTWOOD			
MFG. NUMBER	KIS ICEPATROL			402RSOSO	50lb	AS50	50# HALITE	7-50045-000250-0			
BAGS PER PALLET	49			49	49	49	49	49			
PALLETS PER TRUCKLOAD	18			18	18	10	882	18			
DAYS INSIDE DELIVERY	7 DAYS			3-5 ARO	7 DAYS	2-10 DAYS	1 WEEK	1 DAY			
BUFFALO PUBLIC SCHOOL'S PICKUP	N/A			\$4.10	\$5.50	\$4.23	\$4.35	\$5.49			
BAGS – MINIMUM QUANTITY FOR BPS PICKUP				49	49	1	21	49			
TOTAL BID AMOUNT	\$43,953.28			\$30,870.00	\$47,044.20	\$29,017.80	\$36,859.20	\$47,707.80			
ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT FOR AWARD OF BOTH ITEMS	-				0	0	0	0			
GRAND TOTAL BID	\$43,953.28			\$30,870.00	\$47,044.20	\$29,017.80	\$36,859.20	\$47,707.80			
SUMMARY:											
	CORR	ITEM #1	\$6,227.20								
	DEERE	ITEM #2	\$29,017.80								
	TOTAL AWARD		\$35,245.00								