

VENDORS

Item #	Qty	Description	MFGs Name	Model Number	S & S Worldwide	Riddell	Olympic Den Sports	Anaconda Sports	Modern Custodial Svcs	Aluminum Athletic Eq. Co.	Ad Pro Sports	BSN - US Games	Pyramid School Products	Laux Sporting Goods	Total awarded to low bidder	Low Bidder
1	42	Footballs	Spaulding	Alpha	no bid	no bid	66.35	59.95	no bid		69.85	60.76		57.11	2,398.62	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
2	96	Golf Balls	Nike Vapor Black 2.0	GI0630-101		no bid	37.50	no bid	no bid		12.00	35.88		19.00	1,152.00	Ad Pro Sports
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #							Titleist ProV1				Nike GL0712-101	Nike NKGL0655		OSE Nike Distance Long or Soft		
3	96	Golf Tees	Nike	N75202-000		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		no bid	10.00		4.40	422.40	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #												BSN 60278XXXX				
4	96	Soccer Balls	Spaulding	TF-5000		no bid	39.95	31.49	no bid		39.75	32.98		31.90	3,023.04	Anaconda Sports
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
5	96	Soccer Balls	Spaulding	SC5		no bid	49.95	41.59	no bid		52.50	42.95		39.90	3,830.40	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
6	32	Soccer bags	Nike	BA4877		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		30.00	59.94		19.00	608.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #											Nike Large Dattel	BSN 1385400		Adidas A33498		
7	32	Corner Flags	Champion	SCF60		\$ 38.85	69.85	66.90	no bid	125.00	86.50	6.24	60.00	59.80	1,913.60	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #							Riddell 5FM Set of 4					Alumagoal MSSOCFLGY				
8	40	Soccer Nets	Champion	205		no bid	154.34	152.00 pair	no bid	139.00	196.50	37.46	63.49	139.00	2,539.60	Pyramid
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #												Alumagoal SN3835NRW				

Item #	Qty	Description	MFGs Name	Model Number	S & S Worldwide	Riddell	Olympic Den Sports	Anaconda Sports	Modern Custodial Svcs	Aluminum Athletic Eq. Co.	Ad Pro Sports	BSN - US GAMES	Pyramid School Products	Laux Sporting Goods	Total awarded to low bidder	Low Bidder
9	32	Scorebook	BSN Sports	MSSOCBOK	no bid	\$ 4.95	4.65	no bid	5.99		no bid	3.51		4.82	112.32	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #						Riddell 5BS	Big Red BR506							Brine BSB1		
10	12	Volleyballs	Molten	SuperTouch IV58L-N		no bid	no bid	44.25	no bid		no bid	42.24		37.80	453.60	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
11	84	Volleyballs	Spaulding	VB5 (72-1338)		no bid	47.95	40.75	no bid		48.85	42.54		38.90	3,267.60	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
12	84	Volleyballs	Spaulding	VB3		no bid	37.95	25.60	no bid		44.95	26.59		26.25	2,150.40	Anaconda
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
13	30	Scorebook	BSN Sports			4.62	4.65	no bid	5.99		no bid	3.16		4.29	94.80	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #						Riddell 5BV	Big Red BR502		1111xxxx					Blazer B5020		
14	2000	Adams Mouthpieces without strans	Adams	MG303		0.50	0.35	0.39	no bid		0.55	0.32		0.28	560.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #						M67	Wilson WTFMG1050									
15	64	Baseballs	Spaulding	Pro NFHS		no bid	66.95	67.92 dz	no bid		no bid	54.78		64.25	3,505.92	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
16	16	Bucket w/baseballs	MacGregor	1364706		no bid	no bid	89.95	111.79		169.90	99.48		89.00	1,424.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #								Anaconda			Wilson A1198			Pro Nine		
17	16	Maple Fungo MLF6- 34"	Easton	MLF6		no bid	no bid	48.35	no bid		54.00	39.47		45.00	631.52	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #											Mizuno 340193					

Item #	Qty	Description	MFGs Name	Model Number	S & S Worldwide	Riddell	Olympic Den Sports	Anaconda Sports	Modern Custodial Svcs	Aluminum Athletic Eq. Co.	Ad Pro Sports	BSN - US GAMES	Pyramid School Products	Laux Sporting Goods	Total awarded to low bidder	Low Bidder	
18	20	Louisville Hard Maple Wood Bat Size 32	Louisville	WBHM14 13CBN Adult		no bid	no bid	41.75	no bid		64.00	41.67	39.70	36.90	738.00	Laux	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																	
19	20	Louisville Hard Maple Wood Bat Size 33	Louisville	WBHM14 13CBN Adult		no bid	no bid	41.75	no bid		64.00	41.67	39.70	36.90	738.00	Laux	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																	
20	48	Lax Practice Bals	Champion	PLW		no bid	10.40	11.40 dz	no bid	15.00	14.26	17.72	1.05	0.95	45.60	Laux	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																	
21	48	Lacrosse Balls with NOCSAE stamp and NFHS Stamp	Brine	BLBW		21.74	16.95	no bid	no bid	22.40	no bid	17.72	1.69	15.80	81.12	Pyramid	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #						Riddell Lball * sold in dz	Champion LBW			AAE-OLB-W/12		Maverik 1377138	Champion LBWNOCSAE				
22	4	Scorebook				no bid	4.95	no bid	no bid		no bid	5.68		10.50	22.72	BSN	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #								Big Red BR570				BSN 1377127		Brine BHEP			
23	14	Bucket w/softball	MacGregor	5SBBUC11Y		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		no bid	69.96		90.00	979.44	BSN	
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																	

Item #	Qty	Description	MFGs Name	Model Number	S & S Worldwide	Riddell	Olympic Den Sports	Anaconda Sports	Modern Custodial	Aluminum Athletic Eq.	Ad Pro Sports	BSN - US GAMES	Pyramid School	Laux Sporting Goods	Total awarded to low bidder	Low Bidder
24	16	Louisvill Slugger MENDOZA 32" 19 oz	Louisville	1375568	no bid	no bid	no bid	79.95	no bid		275.00	36.96	72.00	68.90	591.36	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #								FPPR163			Mizuno M229672TD	Louisville Quest 1378363	FPPR163			
25	64	Softball	Spaulding	SB 12		no bid	56.95	59.64 dz	no bid		no bid	51.84		49.50	3,168.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #																
26	16	Tennis Scorebook	Wirtanen	AC1303254		no bid	4.65	no bid	16.99		no bid	13.36		5.00	74.40	Olympic Den
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #							Big Red BR513							Blazer B5130		
27	48	Wilson Tour SlamTennis Racquet	Wilson	WRT32230U3		no bid	18.95	no bid	34.90		no bid	22.14	19.90	32.00	909.60	Olympic Den
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #									1388071							
28	64	Wilson Championship Tennis Balls	Wilson	WRT1003		no bid	58.85	no bid	5.99		no bid	62.88	2.45	64.00	156.80	Pyramid
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #									MTWILKCAN							
29	16	Relay Batons: pack of 6	PortaPit	AAL BAT		no bid	no bid	no bid	2.75	18.00	2.90	7.62		12.00	46.40	Ad Pro
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #									AALBATSI	AAE-BA	Champion RB			Gill G431		
30	24	Starting Block	PortaPit	ASB 3500 X		no bid	no bid	no bid	86.90	95.00	71.50	63.54		82.00	1,524.96	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #									AB53500X	AAE-TSB-PRO	Champion TSB4			Gill G412		
31	70	High School Competition Rocker Hurdle	PortaPit	AHSRX		no bid	no bid	no bid	86.90	81.00	96.75	94.24		92.00	5,670.00	Aluminum Athletic
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #									AHSRX5IL	AAE-HSAH	Fisher HS1200R			Gill G411		
32	16	Shot put 12 lbs	PortaPit			30.10	no bid	no bid	13.90	33.75	29.88	12.32		24.00	197.12	BSN
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #						Riddell 3312				AAE-12I	Fisher SPC12			Gill G3312		
Item #	Qty	Description	MFGs Name	Model Number	S & S Worldwide	Riddell	Olympic Den Sports	Anaconda Sports	Modern Custodial Svcs	Aluminum Athletic Eq. Co.	Ad Pro Sports	BSN - US GAMES	Pyramid School Products	Laux Sporting Goods	Total awarded to low bidder	Low Bidder
33	16	Shot put 8 lbs	PortaPit			20.30	no bid	no bid	10.90	29.00	20.40	8.46		20.00	135.36	BSN

If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #					Riddell 3308			1101591	AAE-8I	Fisher SPC8			Gill GC158		
34	96	Boys Basketballs	Spaulding	TF-1000 Classic	58.80	47.95	41.35	55.90		39.99	41.12		38.25	3,672.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #					Riddell 747838			13369016							
35	96	Girls Basketballs	Spaulding	TF-1000 Classic	58.80	47.95	41.35	55.90		39.99	41.12		38.25	3,672.00	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #					Riddell 747848			1336023							
36	32	Scorebook	Mark V	MSMARKBK	6.00	5.15	5.29	5.90		no bid	3.84		3.82	122.24	Laux
If substituting, indicate MFG. name & model #					Riddell Mark V			.							
Total Award					\$ -	\$ -	\$ 984.00	\$ 5,173.44	\$ -	\$ 5,670.00	\$ 1,198.40	\$ 7,795.52	\$ 2,777.52	\$ 27,034.06	\$ 50,632.94
														\$ 50,632.94	

Item #7 Champion SCF60 Corner Flags  
Riddell  
corner flags riddell bid are for outdoor use only, the champion scf60 are for indoor and outdoor use.

BSN-US Games  
corner flags bsn bid are for outdoor use only, the champion scf60 are for indoor and outdoor use.

Item #8 Champion 205 Soccer Nets  
BSN-US Games bid an Alumagoal model SN383SNRW this netting is only 3mm, the Champion 205 netting is 4 mm bid does not meet specs.

| |