

BID 15-16-014 OFFICE SUPPLIES FOR SERVICE CENTER STOCK OPEN: 08/24/2015 - AT: 11:00 A.M.		WB MASON	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	QUILL CORPORATION	CONTRACT PAPER GROUP	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	MARQUEE	AFP INDUSTRIES INC.				
1) 2000 EA	SCOTCH TAPE ON DISPENSER 1/2" X 800"													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	mmm119	lepage 39203	3m 174	no bid	scotch 608315		3m 119	mmm 119	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 1.19	\$ 0.384	\$ 1.38		\$ 2.31	\$ 1.52	\$ 1.19	\$ 1.49					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 2,380.00	\$ 768.00	\$ 2,760.00		\$ 4,620.00	\$ 3,040.00	\$ 2,380.00	\$ 2,980.00					
2) 360 EA	REMOVABLE TAPE													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	mmm811341296	3m 811-34-1296	3m 810	3m 811-34	scotch 8113412		3m 811	mmm 811341296	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 1.99	\$ 1.88	\$ 2.06	\$ 1.98	\$ 2.18	\$ 2.67	\$ 2.04	\$ 2.51					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 716.40	\$ 676.80	\$ 741.60	\$ 712.80	\$ 784.80	\$ 961.20	\$ 734.40	\$ 903.60					
3) 480 EA	STAPLE REMOVER													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	unv00700	standards 32002	cascade 01804	no bid	quill 793211		pyramid 1111384	universal 00700	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 0.28	\$ 0.198	\$ 0.39		\$ 0.35	\$ 0.29	\$ 0.28	\$ 0.27					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 134.40	\$ 95.04	\$ 187.20		\$ 168.00	\$ 139.20	\$ 134.40	\$ 129.60					
4) 104 BX	4 X 6 INDEX CARDS													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	unv47230-10pk	oxford 41	oxford 40141	no bid	no bid		apc ind46rl	universal 47230	esselte oxford 44				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.97	\$ 6.00			\$ 10.20	\$ 4.70	\$ 0.63	\$ 5.03				
	TOTAL \$	\$ 468.00	\$ 516.88	\$ 624.00			\$ 1,060.80	\$ 488.80	\$ 65.52	\$ 523.12				
5) 3000 BX	STD STAPLES													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	swi35108	swi-35108	swingline 35108	swingline 35 108	wingline 35108q		swingline 35108	swingline 35108	swingline 35108				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 0.66	\$ 0.527	\$ 0.79	\$ 0.62	\$ 0.54	\$ 1.99	\$ 0.54	\$ 0.75	\$ 0.56				
	TOTAL \$	\$ 1,980.00	\$ 1,581.00	\$ 2,370.00	\$ 1,860.00	\$ 1,620.00	\$ 5,970.00	\$ 1,620.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 1,680.00				
6) 3600 BX	3M TRASPARENT TAPE 3M													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	mmm811341296	3m 811-34-1296	3m 811	3m 810-34	no bid		3m 810	mmm 811341296	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 1.99	\$ 1.88	\$ 2.26	\$ 1.34		\$ 1.92	\$ 1.39	\$ 2.51					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 7,164.00	\$ 6,768.00	\$ 8,136.00	\$ 4,824.00		\$ 6,912.00	\$ 5,004.00	\$ 9,036.00					
7) 6000 DZ	BALL POINT PENS													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	pap3311131	pap 331-11	papermate 33111	papermate 33111	papermate 331		papermate 331-11	papermate 33111	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 0.91	\$ 0.919	\$ 1.01	0.92	1.01	1.52	0.79	1.06					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 5,460.00	\$ 5,514.00	\$ 6,060.00	\$ 5,520.00	\$ 6,060.00	\$ 9,120.00	\$ 4,740.00	\$ 6,360.00					
8) 72 ROLL	SELF ADHESIVE CORRECTION TAPE													
	MFG. & ITEM NUMBER	mmm651	3m post it 651	3m 651	no bid	post it 651ea		3m 651	mmm 651	no bid				
	UNIT PRICE \$	\$ 1.37	\$ 1.18	\$ 1.47		\$ 1.38	\$ 1.69	\$ 1.27	\$ 1.59					
	TOTAL \$	\$ 98.64	\$ 84.96	\$ 105.84		\$ 99.36	\$ 121.68	\$ 91.44	\$ 114.48					

