

<b>BID #13-14-127</b> <b>TRASH CAN LINERS</b> <b>OPEN: 6/12/14 - AT: 11:00 A.M.</b> <b>EFFECT: JULY 1, 2014 - DECEMBER 31, 2014</b>	ALL AMERICAN	CALICO INDUSTRIES	CENTRAL POLY	CONTRACT PAPER GROUP Bid Bond	CORR DIST.	DOBMEIER	GRAINGER Bid Bond	HANES Check \$7,671.50	INTERBORO
1. 500 CSE. TRASH CAN LINER - (#10-3538) 24" X 33" HIGH DENSITY, 8 MICRON. CLEAR, 1000 PER CASE IMMEDIATE DELIVERY MFG. # _____ PRODUCT # _____ GAUGE _____ CASE WEIGHT – LBS. _____ CASE WEIGHT – OZS. _____ BAGS PER CASE _____ COST PER LB. _____ CASE PRICE \$ _____ TOTAL COST \$ _____ DELIVERY ARO _____ ALT. _____ PER BAG \$ _____	ALL AMER. POLY 243308-AAP 8 MIC 14.4 1000 \$1.80 \$25.94 \$12,970.00 5-20 DAYS .02594	*REJECTED NO EEO REPORT CALICO 9930428 8 MIC 16.63 50/20 \$1.1226 \$18.67 \$9,335.00 30 .01867	INTERPLAST CENTRAL POLY CP2433N8 8 MIC 16 1000 \$1.01 \$16.80 \$8,400.00 5-10 BUS DAYS .01680	GROUP IBSS243308N 8 MIC 18 1000 \$1.74 \$31.31 \$15,655.00 7-21 DAYS .03131	ALUF CORR #1524 8 MIC 14 NET WT. 1000 \$1.642 \$22.99 \$11,495.00 2-3 WKS *17.3 W/CARDBD. .02299	BERRY PLASTICS HR243308N 8 MIC 16.3 NET W/O BOX 500 - REJECT \$1.29 \$21.04 \$10,520.00 2-3 WKS 9 BX/CS, 1000 .04208	5XL46 5XL46 8 MIC 154.8 9000 - REJECT \$193.36 \$11,020.00 1 DAY/ORDERING 9 BX/CS, 1000 .021485	HDPLR243308N PLR243308N 8 MIC 15.5 1000 \$2.95 \$22,990.00 1-2 WEEKS 0.04598	ALUF PLASTICS/IBS INT-2433-L 8 MIC 16 100 - REJECT \$1.0925925 3-5 DAYS ARO/SAMPLE #10-3538 .12980
2. 300 CSE TRASH CAN LINER - (#10-3455) 30" X 37" HIGH DENSITY, 11 MICRON CLEAR, 500/CSE, INCLUDE TWIST TIES MFG. # _____ PRODUCT # _____ GAUGE _____ CASE WEIGHT – LBS. _____ CASE WEIGHT – OZS. _____ BAGS PER CASE _____ COST PER LB. _____ CASE PRICE \$ _____ TOTAL COST \$ _____ DELIVERY ARO _____ ALT. _____ PER BAG \$ _____	ALL AMER. POLY 303711-AAP 11 MIC 16.4 500 \$1.67 \$27.33 \$8,199.00 5-20 DAYS .05466	CALICO 9930425SP 11 MIC 16 25/20 - REJECT \$1.1337 \$18.14 \$5,442.00 30 .03628	CENTRAL POLY CP-3037N11 11 MIC 16 500 \$1.09 \$17.40 \$5,220.00 5-10 BUS DAYS .03480	INTERPLAST GROUP IBSS303710N 10 MIC - REJECT 17 500 \$1.46 \$24.80 \$7,440.00 7-21 DAYS ARO .04960	ALUF CORR 4344 11 MIC 12 500 \$1.545 \$18.55 \$5,565.00 2-3 WEEKS .03710	BERRY PLASTICS HR303712N 12 MIC 17.3 NET 300 \$1.196 \$20.69 \$6,207.00 2-3 WEEKS .068967	4KN31 4KN31 11 MIC 162.0 4500 - REJECT \$190.35 \$6,345.00 1 DAY/ORDERING 9 BOX/CS, 500/ .04230	HDPLR303110N PLR303110N 10 MIC - REJECT 13.60 500 \$2.91 \$39.53 \$11,859.00 1-2 WEEKS .07906	ALUF PLASTICS/IBS CLEAR INT-3037-MED 11 MIC 16 500 \$1.0794979 \$15.48 \$4,644.00 3-5 DAYS ARO AS PER SAMPLE #10-3455 .030960

3. 1250 CSE TRASH CAN LINER - (#10-3536)  
 33 x 40" HIGH DENSITY, 16 MICRON  
 CLEAR, 250 OR 500/CSE (PLEASE SPECIFY)  
 IMMEDIATE DELIVERY  
 MFG. # \_\_\_\_\_  
 PRODUCT # \_\_\_\_\_  
 GAUGE \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – LBS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – OZS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 BAGS PER CASE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COST PER LB. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE PRICE \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 TOTAL COST \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 DELIVERY ARO \_\_\_\_\_  
 ALT. \_\_\_\_\_  
 PER BAG \$ \_\_\_\_\_

ALL AMERICAN	CALICO	CENTRAL	CONTRACT	CORR	DOBMEIER	GRAINGER	HANES	INTERBORO
ALL AMER. POLY	CALICO	CENTRAL POLY	INTERPLAST GROUP	ALUF	BERRY PLASTICS	4KN33	HDPLR334016N	ALUF PLASTICS/IBS CLEAR
334016-AAP	9930100M	CP3340N16	IBSS334016N	HC334016C	HR334016N	4KN33	PLR334010N	INT-3340-HVY
16 MIC	16 MIC	16 MIC	HVY DUTY-REJECT	16 MIC	16 MIC	16 MIC	16 MIC	16 MIC
12.1	13.90	13	15	12	13.5	129.15	12.9	28
		9	51	192	216 OZ.	8.07	206.4	.55
250	25/10	250	250	250	250	2,250 - REJECT	250	500
\$1.79	\$1.1683	\$1.17	\$1.50	\$1.521	\$1.196	\$ .88	\$2.91	\$1.113231
\$21.61	\$16.24	\$15.20	\$23.27	\$18.26	\$16.14	\$146.25	\$38.02	\$26.84
\$27,012.50	\$20,300.00	\$19,000.00	\$29,087.50	\$22,825.00	\$20,175.00	\$20,312.50	\$47,525.00	\$33,550.00
5-20 DAYS	30	5-10 BUS DAYS	7-21 DAYS		2-3 WEEKS	1 DAY/ORDERING	1-2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS ARO
						9 BOX/CS, 250		AS PER SAMPLE
.08644	.06496	.06080	.09308	.07304	.06456	BG/CS = 2250 BG		#10-3536

4. 100 CSE COMPACTOR BAGS - (#45-1121)  
 17" X 14" X 50", 2 MIL THICK (50.8 MICRONS)  
 POLY OR LINEAR BLEND, LOW DENSITY,  
 OPAQUE COLOR, CLEAR NOT ACCEPTABLE  
 IMMEDIATE DELIVERY  
 MFG. # \_\_\_\_\_  
 PRODUCT # \_\_\_\_\_  
 GAUGE \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – LBS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – OZS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 BAGS PER CASE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COST PER LB. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE PRICE \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 TOTAL COST \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 DELIVERY ARO \_\_\_\_\_  
 ALT. \_\_\_\_\_  
 PER BAG \$ \_\_\_\_\_

SWATCH SAMPLE UNACCEPTABLE						.06500		.05368
ALL AMER. POLY	CALICO	CENTRAL POLY	NO BID	ALUF	BERRY PLASTICS	34864	CLPPK171450BB	ALUF PLASTICS/IBS BLACK
3150XXH-AAP	9911378SP	CP171450K2		CUSTOM	SPECIAL. 17X14X50	34864	CLPPK171450BB	INT-171450-SUPER EXH
2 MIL	2 MIL	2 MIL		2 MIL	2.0 MIL	2 MIL	2 MIL	2 MIL
20	20.5	20		20	20.6 NET	126	20.60	20
		7		320 NET WT.	329.60	7.88	329.6	.67
100	100	100		100	100 CORELESS ROLL	450	100	100
\$0.75	\$ .81024	\$0.80		\$1.109	\$1.25	\$ .58	\$2.40	\$0.9212121
\$14.99	\$16.61	\$16.60		\$22.19	\$25.73	\$217.08	\$57.04	\$15.20
\$1,499.00	\$1,661.00	\$1,660.00		\$2,219.00	\$2,573.00	\$2,412.00	\$5,704.00	\$1,520.00
5-20 DAYS	30				2-3 WEEKS	1 DAY/ORDERING	1-2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS ARO
						9 BX/CS, 150 BG/		PER SAMPLE #45-1121
.14990	.16610	.16600		.221900	.25730	CS = 1350 BG/CS	.57040	.15200
						.160800		

5. 1200 CSE TRASH CAN LINER - (#10-3524)  
 40" X 48" HIGH DENSITY, 22 MIRCON,  
 250 OR 150 PER CASE. ROLLS OR GROUP OR  
 GANG FOLDED. CLEAR OR OPAQUE,  
 INCLUDE TWIST TIES.  
 IMMEDIATE DELIVERY  
 MFG. # \_\_\_\_\_  
 PRODUCT # \_\_\_\_\_  
 GAUGE \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – LBS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE WEIGHT – OZS. \_\_\_\_\_  
 BAGS PER CASE \_\_\_\_\_  
 COST PER LB. \_\_\_\_\_  
 CASE PRICE \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 TOTAL COST \$ \_\_\_\_\_  
 DELIVERY ARO \_\_\_\_\_  
 ALT. \_\_\_\_\_  
 PER BAG \$ \_\_\_\_\_

ALL AMERICAN	CALICO	CENTRAL	CONTRACT	CORR	DOBMEIER	GRAINGER	HANES	INTERBORO
ALL AMER. POLY	CALICO	CENTRAL POLY	ULTRA PLUS	ALUF	BERRY PLASTICS	5BB54	HDPLR434822N	ALUF PLASTICS/IBS CLEAR
404822-AAP	9930163SP	CP404822	WBIHD0404B12N	CORR #1533	HF404822N FOLDED	5BB54	PLR434822N	INT-4048-XH
22 MIC	22 MIC	22 MIC	12 MIC - REJECT	22 MIC	22 MIC	22 MIC	22 MIC	22 MIC
14.5	16.7	16	16	14	16.4 NET	157.05	15.41	17
		6		224	262.4		247	.2
150	25/6	150	250	150	150	1350 - REJECT	150	150
\$1.70	\$.8886	\$0.95	\$2.76	\$1.53	\$1.19	\$.91	\$2.94	\$1.0653789
\$24.72	\$14.84	\$15.80	\$44.21	\$21.42	\$19.55	\$173.43	\$54.46	\$14.34
\$29,664.00	\$17,808.00	\$18,960.00	\$53,052.00	\$25,704.00	\$23,460.00	\$23,124.00	\$65,352.00	\$17,208.00
5-20 DAYS	30	5-10 BUS DAYS	7-21 DAYS ARO		2-3 WEEKS	1 DAY/ORDERING	1-2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS ARO
								SAMPLE #10-3524
.164800	.098934	.105334	.0176840	.142800	.130334	.128467	.36306	.095600
\$79,344.50	\$54,546.00	\$53,240.00	\$105,234.50	\$67,808.00	\$62,935.00	\$63,213.50	\$153,430.00	\$63,412.00
		0	N/A	0	0	0	0	0
\$79,344.50	\$54,546.00	\$53,240.00		\$67,808.00	\$62,935.00	\$63,213.50	\$153,540.00	\$63,412.00
			MIN. \$1500 FOR FREE FRT. REJECT					

PRICING IS REQUIRED FOR A MINIMUM OF SIX MONTHS 7/1/14 THROUGH 12/31/14.

\$ \_\_\_\_\_ TOTAL BID AMOUNT

\$ \_\_\_\_\_ % ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT

FOR AWARD OF ALL ITEMS

\$ \_\_\_\_\_ GRAND TOTAL LESS DISCOUNT

(IF APPLICABLE)

SUMMARY: CENTRAL POLY - \$8,400.00 (#1)  
 INTERBORO - \$56,922.00 (#2 - #5)  
 TOTAL AWARD - \$65,322.00 - (ALL)

#2 SWATCH SAMPLES FROM ALL AMERICAN COULD NOT BE TESTED FOR STRENGTH

P & M PAPER, INC.	UNIPAK CORP.	XPEDX
NO BID	UPC	Z4833LNR01
	243308N	2335732
	8 MIL	8 MIC
	16	16.9
	3	270.4
	1,000	1,000
	\$1.15	\$1.42
	\$18.74	\$24.13
	\$9,370.00	\$12,065.00
	1-15 ARO	NEXT DAY
	.01874	.02413
NO BID	UPS	Z6037MNR01
	334011	5029858
	11 MIL	10 MIC - REJECT
	16	14.9
	-	238.4
	500	500
	1.06	\$1.26
	\$16.86	\$18.84
	\$5,058.00	\$5,652.00
	1-15 ARO	NEXT DAY
	.03372	.03768

P & M	UNIPAK	XPEDX
NO BID	UPC	Z6640VNR01
	334016	5281368
	16 MIC	16 MIC
	13	13.7
	9	219.2
	250	250
	1.06	\$1.30
	\$14.73	\$17.94
	\$18,412.50	\$22,425.00
	1-15 ARO	NEXT DAY
	0.58920	.071760
NO BID	UPC	X6648QK
	502	N/A
	2 MIL	2 MIL
	20	21.1
	6	337.6
	100	100
	\$.85	1.11
	\$17.56	\$23.50
	\$1,756.00	\$2,350.00
	1-15	NEXT DAY
		33" X 48" - 2MIL
	.175600	.235000

P & M	UNIPAK	XPEDX
Z8048WNR01	UPC	Z8048WNR01
6069039	404822	6069039
22 MIC	22	22 MIC
16.	16	16.4
.4	7	262.4
150	150	125 REJECT
	94	\$1.30
\$22.59	\$15.69	\$21.47
\$27,108.00	\$18,828.00	\$25,764.00
	1-15 ARO	NEXT DAY
.150600	.104600	.171760
\$27,108.00	\$53,424.50	\$68,256.00
		0
	\$53,424.50	\$68,256.00