

BID #13-14-097 TEXAS INSTRUMENTS STUDENT CALCULATORS FOR SERVICE CENTER STOCK OPEN: 4/7/14 - AT: 11:00 A.M.		CONTRACT PAPER GROUP	EAI	ETA	FISHER SCIENCE	GLOBAL	OM OFFICE SUPPLY	SCHOOL SAVERS	VALLEY BUSINESS	
		B/B 25%	C) \$8,318.43		B/B/ 25%		-	C) \$8,207.91	C) \$8,097.86	
THE BUFFALO BOARD OF EDUCATION RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD BY LINE ITEM, LOT # OR TOTAL BID PRICE.							BID REJECTED DID NOT SUBMIT BID SECURITY			
1	1093 EA LOT 1 ITEMS 1-2 <u>TI NSPIRE CX GRAPHING CALCULATORS</u> WITH COLOR SCREEN WITH RECHARGEABLE BATTERY TEXAS INSTRUMENTS 505 TI-NSPIRE CX – NO SUB ONE SHIPMENT DOCK DELIVERY: BUFFALO, N.Y. 14222 UNIT PRICE \$ _____ TOTAL \$ _____ WARRANTY _____	\$137.82 \$150,637.26 TI	\$123.40 \$134,876.20 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$128.87 \$140,854.91 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$126.00 \$137,718.00 1 YEAR	\$121.74 \$133,061.82 1 YEAR	\$120.07 \$131,236.51 1 YEAR	
2	245 EA <u>TI 84 PLUS CALCULATORS</u> SILVER EDITION GRAPHING BLACK TEXAS INSTRUMENTS TI-84 + SE COLOR – NO SUB ONE SHIPMENT DOCK DELIVERY: BUFFALO, N.Y. 14222 UNIT PRICE \$ _____ TOTAL \$ _____ WARRANTY _____ LOT 1 ITEMS 1-2 TOTAL \$ _____	\$130.14 \$31,884.30 TI	\$116.50 \$28,542.50 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$121.65 \$29,804.25 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$118.00 \$28,910.00 1 YEAR	\$114.74 \$28,111.30 1 YEAR	\$113.35 \$27,770.75 1 YEAR	
3	250 EA <u>TI 30 MULTIVIEW SCIENTIFIC CALCULATORS</u> TEXAS INSTRUMENTS TI30XSMV – NO SUBSTITUTES ONE SHIPMENT INSIDE DELIVERY TO: BFLO, N.Y. 14201 UNIT PRICE \$ _____ TOTAL \$ _____ WARRANTY _____	\$13.83 \$3,457.50 TI	\$11.80 \$2,950.00 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$12.37 \$3,092.50 1 YEAR	NO BID NO BID 1 YEAR	\$12.40 \$3,100.00 1 YEAR	\$11.94 \$2,985.00 1 YEAR	\$11.80 \$2,950.00 1 YEAR	

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ALL ITEMS \$ _____	\$185,979.06	\$166,368.70		\$173,751.66		\$169,728.00	\$164,158.12	\$161,957.26	
TOTAL AWARD DISCOUNT \$ _____	0	0		0		0	0	0	
DELIVERY PROMISE _____	7-21 DAYS	2-10 DAYS		3-5 DAYS		10 DAYS	10-14 DAYS	7-10 DAYS	
<p>IT IS THE INTENT FOR THE BUFFALO BOARD OF EDUCATION TO RE-ORDER SIMILAR QUANTITIES FOR THE CURRENT 2013-2014 SCHOOL YEAR. IF REQUIRED, CAN ADDITIONAL UNITS BE PURCHASED WITH THE ABOVE QUOTED PRICES AND CONDITIONS REMAINING FIRM THROUGH 6/30/14.</p> <p>YES _____ NO _____</p> <p>IF NO, PLEASE SPECIFY EXPIRATION DATE OF ABOVE QUOTED PRICES (MIN. 60 DAYS) _____</p>									
	YES	YES		YES		YES	YES	YES	