

3) 300 EA

MOP HANDLE - (#010-3371)
 1-1/8" X 60", HEAVY DUTY HARDWOOD, RUST
 RESISTANT WIRE JAWS HOLDS ANY SIZE MOPHEAD
 NORAM IND 6076 WET GRIP, WILEN SUREGRIP 910-60
 OR EQUAL. FIBERGLASS UNACCEPTABLE

MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

AFP	CALICO	CHUDY	CORR	DOBMEIER	INTERLINE	WB MASON	PYRAMID	XPEDX
SAMPLE UN-ACCEPTABLE ROD AND SCREW				*				
ABCO	WILEN	IMPACT	WILEN	WILEN	RUBBER MAID	SAALFELD	WILEN	GOLDEN STAR
01203-NB	A71012	99	60-A71002910	A71002/6076	FGH216000000		NEW # A70602	HWM1185G
6/CASE	12/CASE	12/CASE	EACH	12	12		12/CARTON	EACH
\$4.92	\$7.54	\$7.65	\$7.16	\$7.02	\$7.95	\$5.49	\$6.79	\$9.68
\$1,476.00	\$2,262.00	\$2,295.00	\$2,148.00	\$2,106.00	\$2,385.00	\$1,647.00	\$2,037.00	\$2,904.00
6/30/2014	90 DAYS	12/31/2014	12/31/2014	12/31/2014	8/31/2014		6/30/2014	6/30/2014
14 DAYS	5 DAYS	10-15 DAYS	21 DAYS	2-3 WEEKS	5-7 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	3 DAYS
MP BOD	GREENWOOD	IMPACT	IMPACT	IMPACT	RENOWN		IMPACT	IMPACT 5506
	270	5506	5506	5506	751584	LAGIMP5506	5506	5232502
	12/CASE	48/CASE	EACH	12	1-10 QT.		12/CARTON	48
	\$1.98	\$2.20	\$2.04	\$2.575	\$5.23	\$2.85	\$2.49	\$2.49
	\$1,386.00	\$1,540.00	\$1,428.00	\$1,802.50	\$3,661.00	\$1,995.00	\$1,743.00	\$1,743.00
	90 DAYS	12/31/2014	12/31/2014	-			6/30/2014	6/30/2014
	5 DAYS	-	7-14 DAYS	2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	4 DAYS
	10 QT.							
	UNACCEPT. SIZE							

4) 700 EA

PAIL - (#010-3395)
 PLASTIC W/HANDLE 6 QT. CAPACITY 8"X6-3/4" DIA.
 REINFORCED UPPER LIP IMPACT 5506 OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

5) 80 EA

PAD - (#010-3411)
 CLEANING, GREEN 17", 100% VIRGIN POLYESTER &
 NYLON FIBERS, RESILIENT OPEN WEB DESIGN, 5 PER
 CASE, MUST CONFORM TO FED. SPEC 00P0040D
 (GSA-FSS) GLIT THICKLINE, 3M OR EQUAL
 MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

AFP	CALICO	CHUDY	CORR	DOBMEIER	INTERLINE	MASON	PYRAMID	XPEDX
NO BID	AMERCAO	3M NIAGARA	AMERICO	3M NIAGARA	CON.COM.		ACS	RELIABLE (3M)
	400317	5400N	2714	5400N	-	AM0400317	55-17	2255002
	5/CASE	5/CASE	5/CASE	5/CASE	5/CASE		5/CARTON	5
	\$1.84	\$1.64	\$1.66	\$1.73	\$2.61	\$1.73	\$1.61	\$1.85
	\$147.20	\$131.20	\$132.80	\$138.40	\$208.80	\$138.40	\$128.80	\$148.00
	90 DAYS	12/31/2014	12/31/2014	6/30/2014	-		6/30/2014	6/30/2014
	5 DAYS	10 DAYS	21 DAYS	2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	2 DAYS
NO BID	NO BID	HOSPECO	STAR	CLARKE	KIMBERLY CLARKE		MDI	KIMBERLY CLARKE
		HD-57501	1221-13250	1221 BLUE	KC-41041	LAGRLCC33570	95134	33570
		150	250/CASE	250/CSE 12x21"	160/BOX/CSE.		600/CSE 17x19"	500/CASE
		\$16.00	\$25.85	\$23.45	\$24.10	\$40.57	\$53.98	\$50.99
		\$640.00	\$1,034.00	\$938.00	\$964.00	\$1,622.80	\$2,159.20	\$2,039.60
		8/1/2014	12/31/2014	12/31/2014			6/30/2014	1/30/2015
		7-10 DAYS	7-10 DAYS	2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	2 DAYS

6) 40 CSE

WIPES - (#010-3415)
 REUSEABLE SHOP 20X13", 250/CASE, KIMTEX POPUP,
 KIMBERLY CLAR 33570, IROQUOIS STK222614(12X12")
 OR EQUAL. PROVIDE SAMPLE OF ALTERNATE W/BID.
 MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 CASE \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

7) 300 CSE

MULTI SURFACE CLEANER - (#010-3431)
 MUST BE GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED 2-1/2 GAL.PER CSE,
 CORR LOCK-N-FIL PEROXIDE CLEANER/DEGREASER
 CORR 3704 OR EQUAL.

MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 CASE \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

AFP	CALICO	CHUDY	CORR	DOBMEIER	INTERLINE	MASON	PYRAMID	XPEDX
NO BID	NO BID	NCL	MISCO	NO BID	RENOWM	BETCO	NO BID	"PROXI"
		EARTH SENSE 18	3704		REN02878	BCC3360400		5284266
		6: 1/2 GAL/CSE	2: 1/2 GAL/CSE		4X1 GAL/CSE			4/CASE
		\$1.05	\$42.07		\$11.86	\$50.58		\$79.00
		\$10,500.00	\$12,621.00		\$3,558.00	\$15,174.00		\$23,700.00
		12/31/2014	12/31/2015		-			6/30/2014
		10-15 DAYS	10 DAYS		3-5 DAYS			2 DAYS

8) 60 EA

DUST MOP FRAME - (#010-3527)
 24" X 3" FRAME ONLY, SWIVEL SNAP ON STYLE,
 WILEN 324-2 RUBBERMAID M-233, GOLDEN STAR
 FNQ24 OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

AFP	CALICO	CHUDY	CORR	DOBMEIER	INTERLINE	MASON	PYRAMID	XPEDX
WILEN	ABCO 5 X 24"	O'DELL CORP 4954959324	GOLDEN STAR	SSS GOLDEN STAR	RUBBERMAID	RUBBERMAID	GOLDEN STAR	GOLDEN STAR
C702024	BH24524	F243	FNQ24	37886	FGM253000000	RUB010-3527	FNQ24	FNQ24
12/CASE	12/CASE	12/CASE	EACH	12/CASE	12		12/CARTON	EACH
\$1.91	\$1.84	\$2.21	\$2.54	\$1.62	\$2.10	\$2.94	\$2.98	\$2.68
\$114.60	\$110.40	\$132.60	\$152.40	\$97.20	\$126.00	\$176.40	\$178.80	\$160.80
6/30/2014	90 DAYS	-	12/31/2014	-	-		6/30/2014	6/30/2014
14 DAYS	5 DAYS	-	21 DAYS	2 WEEKS	5-7 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	2 DAYS

9) 180 EA MOP PAIL - (#045-0983)
 OVAL WITH CASTERS, 35 QT. HEAVY DUTY PLASTIC,
 WRINGER CO.2635,MARINO 2603,CONTINENTAL 335-3
 OR EQUAL.
 COLOR _____
 MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

10) 300 CAN CLEANSER - (#045-1009)
 21 OZ. SHAKER CAN SSS CHLORINE CLEANSER, 30
 MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 CAN \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

11) 700 EA DUST MOP REFILL - (#010-3531)
 18"X3" MICROFIBER,WILEN 318-1,RUBBERMAID K-332
 OR EQUAL
 MANUFACTURE _____
 NUMBER _____
 COUNT _____
 EACH \$ _____
 TOTAL \$ _____
 EXPIRATION DATE _____
 DELIVERY ARO _____

AFP	CALICO	CHUDY	CORR	DOBMEIER	INTERLINE	MASON	PYRAMID	XPEDX
YELLOW	YELLOW	YELLOW	YELLOW	YOUR CHOICE	YELLOW	YELLOW	YELLOW	TBD
	RUBBERMAID	IMPACT	MARINO	CONT	APPEAL CO.	CONTINENTAL	IMPACT	CONTINENTAL
335-3	757088	2635-34	2603	335-3	-	COCP335312YW	2635-34	335-3
1/CASE	4/CASE	1	EACH	1	1		EACH	EACH
\$26.65	\$32.44	\$23.05	\$28.60	\$27.05	\$37.93	\$46.88	\$23.19	\$31.86
\$4,797.00	\$5,839.20	\$4,149.00	\$5,148.00	\$4,869.00	\$6,827.40	\$8,438.40	\$4,174.20	\$5,734.90
6/30/2014	90 DAYS	-	12/31/2014	12/31/2014	-		6/30/2014	6/30/2014
14 DAYS	5 DAYS	-	21 DAYS	2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	5 DAYS
				ORIGINAL KITCHEN KLEENZER				
NO BID	NO BID	FRANKLIN BABO	NO BID		NO BID		BABO	CPL AJAX
		-		64001		CALICCP752088	P752088	1166143
		24/CASE		24/CASE			24/CASE	24
		\$.60		\$.54		\$.71	\$.96	\$1.00
		\$180.00		\$162.00		\$213.00	\$288.00	\$300.00
		8/1/2014		6/30/2014			6/30/2014	6/30/2014
		10 DAYS		1 WEEK			10-14 DAYS	3 DAYS
				GOLDEN STAR FUSION				
WILEN 318-1	A&B	O'DELL	NO BID		RUBBERMAID	NO BID	MILEN 318-1	GOLDEN STAR
C092018	M850018	-		ASA1	041800GR		NEW#C092018	ASA-1
12/CASE	12/CASE			12/CASE	1		12/CARTON	12
\$3.34	\$2.74	\$4.50		\$7.22	\$8.37		\$3.69	\$7.89
\$2,338.00	\$1,918.00	\$3,150.00		\$5,054.00	\$5,859.00		\$2,583.00	\$5,523.00
6/14/2014	90 DAYS	-		6/30/2014	-		6/30/2014	6/30/2014
14 DAYS	5 DAYS	-		2 WEEKS	3-5 DAYS		10-14 DAYS	3 DAYS

