

Bid# 17-0617E2-013
Maintainance for Printing Equip.
Mon. July 25th, 2016 @ 11:00am

VENDORS

	Comgraph		Image Supply Source		Standard Duplicating		HFW Industries	
	yearly cost	replace	yearly cost	replace	yearly cost	replace		
	Paul Melville - Room 177							
Bourg Collator	\$300.00				NO BID			
Baum Folder	\$220.00				NO BID			
Right Angle Attachment	\$120.00				NO BID			
Interlake Stitcher (IL305)	\$125.00				\$365.00			
Nutco Platemaker	\$2,500.00				\$365.00			
X-Rite Shrink Wrap Sealer	\$125.00				NO BID			
Master Converter/Solna Pre	\$125.00				NO BID			
AB Dick Offset Press	\$450.00	\$900.00			NO BID			
Ryobi 2800 Offset Press (13461)	\$450.00	\$220.00			NO BID			
Ryobi 2800 Offset Press (13462)	\$450.00	\$220.00			NO BID			
Ryobi 3200 Offset Press	\$450.00	\$240.00			NO BID			
Baumcut 31.5 Paper Cutter	\$125.00				NO BID			
Standard Digital Duplicator	\$375.00				NO BID			
Baum Drill (D3HDA)	\$125.00				\$225.00			
Baum Drill (CY111)	\$125.00				\$225.00			
USI Laminator	\$125.00				NO BID			
Glunz & Jenzen Plate Writer	\$6,000.00				\$225.00			
Foil Stamper	\$125.00				\$365.00			
Interlake Stitcher (10459)	\$125.00				NO BID			
SD460 Dig. Duplicator (16065)	\$125.00				NO BID			
SD460 Dig. Duplicator (16064)	\$125.00				NO BID			
Laquida Shedrick - Room 176								
A.W.T. Hot Flash Dryer (65272)	\$600.00				NO BID			
A.W.T. Hot Flash Dryer (570-1)	\$600.00				NO BID			
A.W.T. Hot Flash Dryer (570-2)	\$600.00				NO BID			
8 Station 8 Color Master Printer	\$200.00				NO BID			

4 Station 6 Color Press	\$200.00				NO BID		
Conveyor Dryer Cure-Tex	\$300.00				NO BID		
Screen Dry-It	\$300.00				NO BID		
A.W.T. Exposure Unit	\$125.00				NO BID		
Wilson - Room 181							
Horizon MT 100 Stapler Folder	\$125.00	\$365.00			\$365.00		
Horizon Paper Cutter	\$350.00	\$675.00			\$675.00		
Standard Paper Drill	\$125.00	\$360.00			\$365.00		
Epson Stylus Pro 7900	NO BID				NO BID		
Guy - Room 187							
Digital Duplicator (SD-700 06)	\$125.00				NO BID		
Digital Duplicator (SD-700 08)	\$125.00				NO BID		
Digital Duplicator (SD-460)	\$125.00				NO BID		
EEO Letter							
	Yes				No		
EEO Chart							
	Yes				Yes		
Bid Bond/Certified Check							
	N/A				N/A		
Total Award Discount							
	Not Specified				Not Specified		
GRAND TOTAL	\$18,700.00			NO BID	\$3,765.00		NO BID

