

BID # 17-0617E2-006 Musical Instrument Repairs Wednesday July 27th, 2016	VENDORS							
	Small Musical Services	Buffalo Drum Outlet	Chimes Music Corp	Monaco's Violin Shop	Sosha Enterprises			
return - bussiness days	Up to 28 Business Days	within 21 Business Days	within 21 Business Days					
spare & repair parts inventory \$	\$6,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00					
additional cost w/prior approval per hr \$	\$55.00	\$60.00	\$20.00					
emergency repairs \$	\$75.00	\$60.00	\$40.00					
PERCUSSIONS \$	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Bass Drum 28"		\$62.00						
30"		\$66.90						
Timpani 20"		\$49.50						
24"		\$55.00						
28"		\$61.00						
32"		\$72.00						
Snare Drum 14"		\$16.00						
16"		\$18.00						
Tom Tom 10"		\$17.50						
12"		\$19.80						
13"		\$20.25						
14"		\$21.00						
16"		\$23.50						
Snares (12 strand)		\$16.00						
Snare Throwoffs per		\$28.00						
Lugs (per lug)		\$4.50						
Tuning		No Charge						
Clips		\$4.50						
Adjustments		No Charge						
WOODWINDS \$		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
Clarinet Bflat/Eflat 1 \$	\$30.00		\$30.00					
2 \$	\$50.00		\$50.00					
3 \$	\$75.00		\$60.00					
4 \$	\$100.00		\$80.00					

Bid # 17-0617E2-006

Alto Clarinet (all) 1 \$	\$40.00	\$50.00					
2 \$	\$60.00	\$70.00					
3 \$	\$75.00	\$80.00					
4 \$	\$100.00	\$100.00					
Bass Clarinet (all) 1 \$	\$50.00	\$70.00					
2 \$	\$75.00	\$90.00					
3 \$	\$100.00	\$100.00					
4 \$	\$125.00	\$125.00					
Flute/Piccolo 1 \$	\$30.00	\$30.00					
2 \$	\$50.00	\$50.00					
3 \$	\$75.00	\$60.00					
4 \$	\$100.00	\$80.00					
Oboe 1 \$	\$35.00	\$50.00					
2 \$	\$60.00	\$60.00					
3 \$	\$85.00	\$80.00					
4 \$	\$100.00	\$100.00					
Bassoon 1 \$	\$50.00	\$75.00					
2 \$	\$75.00	\$100.00					
3 \$	\$90.00	\$125.00					
4 \$	\$125.00	\$175.00					
Saxophone: Soprano 1 \$	\$35.00	\$30.00					
2 \$	\$55.00	\$50.00					
3 \$	\$80.00	\$60.00					
4 \$	\$100.00	\$80.00					
Alto 1 \$	\$40.00	\$40.00					
2 \$	\$60.00	\$60.00					
3 \$	\$85.00	\$70.00					
4 \$	\$100.00	\$90.00					
Tenor 1 \$	\$45.00	\$50.00					
2 \$	\$65.00	\$75.00					
3 \$	\$90.00	\$90.00					

	4 \$	\$125.00		\$125.00				
Bid # 17-0617E2-006								
	Baritone (all) 1 \$	\$50.00		\$75.00				
	2 \$	\$75.00		\$100.00				
	3 \$	\$110.00		\$150.00				
	4 \$	\$150.00		\$200.00				
	Bass 1 \$	\$55.00		\$100.00				
	2 \$	\$80.00		\$150.00				
	3 \$	\$115.00		\$200.00				
	4 \$	\$150.00		\$250.00				
	Other Work:							
	Pinn Fill Cracks on Wood Instruments \$	\$30.00		\$10.00				
	Joint Corks - first \$	\$10.00		\$15.00				
	each Additional \$	\$5.00		\$10.00				
	Saxophone neck cords \$	\$10.00		\$20.00				
	Soft Solder Work- first juncture \$	\$10.00		\$25.00				
	each Additional \$	\$8.00		\$20.00				
	Silver Solder work -per juncture \$	\$20.00		\$40.00				
	B Flat Tenon receiver replacement \$	\$100.00		\$100.00				
	B Flat Clarinet tenon replacement \$	\$100.00		\$100.00				
	Thumbrest	\$10.00		\$10.00				
	Case Repair (supply & install)							
	Case Handles - per handle \$	\$15.00		\$15.00				
	Case Latches - per latch \$	\$15.00		\$15.00				
	Case Hinges - per hinge \$	\$10.00		\$15.00				
	BRASS \$	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
	Instruments:							
	Category 2							
	Trumpet/Cornet \$							
	Trombone (Tenor) \$							
	Trombone (valve) \$							
	Trombone (Bass) \$							
	Baritone Horn \$							

Bid # 17-0617E2-006								
French Horn (single) \$								
French Horn (double) \$								
Tuba - small \$								
large \$								
upright \$								
Sousaphone \$								
Other Work:								
Free up sticky valves - per valve \$								
Tuning Slides - per stuck slide \$								
Soft Solder work if needed								
First Juncture \$								
each Additional \$								
Silver Solder - per juncture \$								
clean&restring rotary valves each \$								
Trombone slidework:								
alignment small dents \$								
professional cleaning \$								
Finger Buttons - per button \$								
Valve Caps - top \$								
bottom \$								
Finger Ring \$								
Waterkey assembly \$								
Braces:								
Trumpet Braces - per Brace \$								
Trombone Braces - per Brace \$								
Baritone Horn Braces - per Brace \$								
Tuba Braces - per Brace \$								
French Horn Braces - per Brace \$								
Case Repair:								
Case Handles - per handle \$								
Case Latches - per latch \$								
Case Hinges - per hinge \$								

Bid # 17-0617E2-006								
All Trombone (30) \$								
Trumpets (60) \$								
Tuba (5) \$								
Bari Horn (5) \$								
Cornet (5) \$								
STRINGS \$	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
String Replacement:								
Violin A \$			\$6.00					
C \$			No Bid					
D \$			\$7.00					
E \$			\$5.00					
G \$			\$8.00					
Set \$			\$26.00					
Viola A \$			\$7.00					
C \$			\$12.00					
D \$			\$8.00					
E \$			No Bid					
G \$			\$9.00					
Set \$			\$36.00					
Cello A \$			\$18.00					
C \$			\$25.00					
D \$			\$20.00					
E \$			No Bid					
G \$			\$22.00					
Set \$			\$85.00					
Bass A \$			\$35.00					
C \$			No Bid					
D \$			\$30.00					
E \$			\$40.00					
G \$			\$28.00					
Set \$			\$133.00					

Bid # 17-0617E2-006

Case Repair:							
Handle \$		No Bid					
Latch \$		No Bid					
Hinge \$		No Bid					
Bow Holder \$		No Bid					
Bridge:							
Violin							
maple w/ebony inset \$		\$18.00					
Refit \$		\$10.00					
Viola							
maple w/ebony inset \$		\$18.00					
Refit \$		\$10.00					
Cello							
maple w/ebony inset \$		\$30.00					
Refit \$		\$20.00					
Bass							
maple w/ebony inset \$		\$75.00					
Refit \$		\$40.00					
Soundpost:							
Violin							
(spruce) Straight w/proper angles \$		\$20.00					
Reset & adjust \$		\$10.00					
Viola							
(spruce) Straight w/proper angles \$		\$20.00					
Reset & adjust \$		\$10.00					
Cello							
(spruce) Straight w/proper angles \$		\$30.00					
Reset & adjust \$		\$15.00					
Bass							
(spruce) Straight w/proper angles \$		\$40.00					
Reset & adjust \$		\$20.00					

Bid # 17-0617E2-006

Chinrest							
Violin							
Furnish & instal plastic \$			\$10.00				
Viola							
Furnish & instal plastic \$			\$10.00				
Cello							
Furnish & instal plastic \$			No Bid				
Bass							
Furnish & instal plastic \$			No Bid				
Endpin							
Violin							
Furnish-Ebony w/18" rod for Cello			No Bid				
Ebony w/12 1/2 " rod for Bass \$			No Bid				
Straighten \$			No Bid				
Taper & fit \$			\$10.00				
Viola							
Furnish-Ebony w/18" rod for Cello			No Bid				
Ebony w/12 1/2 " rod for Bass \$			No Bid				
Straighten \$			No Bid				
Taper & fit \$			\$10.00				
Cello							
Furnish-Ebony w/18" rod for Cello			\$15.00				
Ebony w/12 1/2 " rod for Bass \$			\$15.00				
Straighten \$			\$10.00				
Taper & fit \$			\$15.00				
Bass							
Furnish-Ebony w/18" rod for Cello			\$20.00				
Ebony w/12 1/2 " rod for Bass \$			\$20.00				
Straighten \$			\$15.00				
Taper & fit \$			\$20.00				
Cracks:							
Glue from outside							
Violin							

Bid # 17-0617E2-006

Top - per crack \$		\$20.00				
Back - per crack \$		\$20.00				
Bout - per opening \$		\$20.00				
Remove top - replace after opening \$		\$75.00				
Glue & reinforce cracks from inside after		\$75.00				
Viola						
Top - per crack \$		\$20.00				
Back - per crack \$		\$20.00				
Bout - per opening \$		\$20.00				
Remove top - replace after opening \$		\$75.00				
Glue & reinforce cracks from inside after		\$75.00				
Cello						
Top - per crack \$		\$30.00				
Back - per crack \$		\$30.00				
Bout - per opening \$		\$30.00				
Remove top - replace after opening \$		\$90.00				
Glue & reinforce cracks from inside after		\$90.00				
Bass						
Top - per crack \$		\$40.00				
Back - per crack \$		\$40.00				
Bout - per opening \$		\$40.00				
Remove top - replace after opening \$		\$100.00				
Glue & reinforce cracks from inside after		\$100.00				
Tuners:						
Violin						
Furnish & install (each) \$		\$5.00				
Viola						
Furnish & install (each) \$		\$5.00				
Cello						
Furnish & install (each) \$		\$10.00				
Bass						
Furnish & install (each) \$		\$75.00				
Pegs:						

Violin							
Proper taper on peg an in scroll \$			\$50.00				
Refit pegs: fine ebony \$			\$15.00				
Service gears \$			No Charge				
Tenson Rosewood pegs \$			\$75.00				
Tenson plastic pegs \$			\$30.00				
Viola							
Proper taper on peg an in scroll \$			\$50.00				
Refit pegs: fine ebony \$			\$15.00				
Bid # 17-0617E2-006							
Service gears \$			No Charge				
Tenson Rosewood pegs \$			\$75.00				
Tenson plastic pegs \$			\$30.00				
Cello							
Proper taper on peg an in scroll \$			\$75.00				
Refit pegs: fine ebony \$			\$20.00				
Service gears \$			No Charge				
Tenson Rosewood pegs \$			\$90.00				
Tenson plastic pegs \$			\$50.00				
Bass							
Proper taper on peg an in scroll \$			\$129.00				
Refit pegs: fine ebony \$			\$25.00				
Service gears \$			\$40.00				
Tenson Rosewood pegs \$			No Charge				
Tenson plastic pegs \$			No Charge				
Fingerboard:							
Violin							
Reglue \$			\$25.00				
Dress & refinish \$			\$25.00				
Nut-Furnish & Fit (fine ebony) \$			\$20.00				
Nut-Reglue & Adjust \$			No Charge				
Viola							
Reglue \$			\$25.00				

Dress & refinish \$		\$25.00					
Nut-Furnish & Fit (fine ebony) \$		\$20.00					
Nut-Reglue & Adjust \$		No Charge					
Cello							
Reglue \$		\$30.00					
Dress & refinish \$		\$30.00					
Nut-Furnish & Fit (fine ebony) \$		\$30.00					
Nut-Reglue & Adjust \$		No Charge					
Bass							
Bid # 17-0617E2-006							
Reglue \$		\$50.00					
Dress & refinish \$		\$75.00					
Nut-Furnish & Fit (fine ebony) \$		\$35.00					
Nut-Reglue & Adjust \$		No Charge					
Neck:							
Violin							
Glue: set & adjust \$		\$35.00					
Glue & reinforce		\$55.00					
Remove & Reglue \$		\$75.00					
Viola							
Glue: set & adjust \$		\$35.00					
Glue & reinforce		\$55.00					
Remove & Reglue \$		\$75.00					
Cello							
Glue: set & adjust \$		\$45.00					
Glue & reinforce		\$75.00					
Remove & Reglue \$		\$90.00					
Bass							
Glue: set & adjust \$		\$55.00					
Glue & reinforce		\$75.00					
Remove & Reglue \$		\$100.00					
Tailpiece:							
Violin							

Finish & install \$		\$25.00					
New tail gut (sacconi) \$		\$10.00					
Fit with cable (bass only) \$		No Bid					
Master tuner - metel tailpiece \$		\$55.00					
Viola							
Finish & install \$		\$25.00					
New tail gut (sacconi) \$		\$10.00					
Fit with cable (bass only) \$		No Bid					
Master tuner - metel tailpiece \$		\$55.00					
Bid # 17-0617E2-006							
Cello							
Finish & install \$		\$30.00					
New tail gut (sacconi) \$		\$15.00					
Fit with cable (bass only) \$		No Bid					
Master tuner - metel tailpiece \$		\$275.00					
Bass							
Finish & install \$		\$35.00					
New tail gut (sacconi) \$		\$20.00					
Fit with cable (bass only) \$		\$25.00					
Master tuner - metel tailpiece \$		No Charge					
Saddle:							
Violin							
Finish & install \$		\$15.00					
Reglue & adjust \$		No Charge					
Viola							
Finish & install \$		\$15.00					
Reglue & adjust \$		No Charge					
Cello							
Finish & install \$		\$20.00					
Reglue & adjust \$		No Charge					
Bass							
Finish & install \$		\$25.00					
Reglue & adjust \$		No Charge					

Repairs To Bows:							
Violin							
Rehair processed bow hair only \$		\$20.00					
Replace tip \$		\$20.00					
Replace screw and eyelet \$		\$20.00					
Replace eyelet (only) - brass \$		\$10.00					
Replace grip (leather) \$		\$10.00					
Replace button-silver one piece \$		\$5.00					
Replace plug or wedge (each) \$		\$10.00					
Bid # 17-0617E2-006							
Replace slide \$		\$10.00					
Replace ferrule ring \$		\$10.00					
Replace frog (ebony, half-lined) \$		\$30.00					
Replace frog (plastic for fiberglass) \$		\$15.00					
Viola							
Rehair processed bow hair only \$		\$20.00					
Replace tip \$		\$20.00					
Replace screw and eyelet \$		\$20.00					
Replace eyelet (only) - brass \$		\$10.00					
Replace grip (leather) \$		\$10.00					
Replace button-silver one piece \$		\$5.00					
Replace plug or wedge (each) \$		\$10.00					
Replace slide \$		\$10.00					
Replace ferrule ring \$		\$10.00					
Replace frog (ebony, half-lined) \$		\$30.00					
Replace frog (plastic for fiberglass) \$		\$15.00					
Cello							
Rehair processed bow hair only \$		\$30.00					
Replace tip \$		\$30.00					
Replace screw and eyelet \$		\$30.00					
Replace eyelet (only) - brass \$		\$15.00					
Replace grip (leather) \$		\$10.00					
Replace button-silver one piece \$		\$10.00					

Replace plug or wedge (each) \$			\$15.00					
Replace slide \$			\$15.00					
Replace ferrule ring \$			\$15.00					
Replace frog (ebony, half-lined) \$			\$40.00					
Replace frog (plastic for fiberglass) \$			\$20.00					
Bass								
Rehair processed bow hair only \$			\$40.00					
Replace tip \$			\$40.00					
Replace screw and eyelet \$			\$40.00					
Bid # 17-0617E2-006								
Replace eyelet (only) - brass \$			\$20.00					
Replace grip (leather) \$			\$10.00					
Replace button-silver one piece \$			\$10.00					
Replace plug or wedge (each) \$			\$20.00					
Replace slide \$			\$20.00					
Replace ferrule ring \$			\$20.00					
Replace frog (ebony, half-lined) \$			\$50.00					
Replace frog (plastic for fiberglass) \$			\$25.00					
	Small Music Services	Buffalo Drum Outlet	Chimes Music Corp.					
EEO Chart	Yes	Yes	Yes					
EEO Policy Letter	Sole Proprietor	Yes	Sole Proprietor					
Bid Bond/Certified Check	N/A	N/A	N/A					
Families of instruments totals below added up by taking the cost per instrument repair per family for the total								
Strings Total	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,650.00	No Bid	No Bid			
Percussions Total	No Bid	\$555.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Woodwinds Total	\$3,753.00	No Bid	\$4,110.00	No Bid	No Bid			
Brass Total	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Estimated Yearly Total	\$9,000.00	\$555.45	\$6,000.00	No Bid	No Bid			

